---- Forwarded Message -----

From: Info Gms <info@gms-tampa.com>

To: Steve Lockom <slockom@yahoo.com>

Sent. Wednesday, June 25, 2025 at 08:40:10 PM EDT
Subject: Re: public record's request

Here you go!
On Wed, Jun 25, 2025 at 2:22 PM Steve Lockom <slockom@yahoo.com> wrote:

Amanda, | can understand that Michelle may need to work some language on the
contract but please send me the detail of the proposal.

Thanks,
Steve

Yahoo Mail: Search, Organize, Conquer

On Wed, Jun 25, 2025 at 11:23 AM, Info Gms
<info@gms-tampa.com> wrote:

On Wed, Jun 25, 2025 at 11:23 AM Info Gms <info@gms-tampa.com> wrote:
| am working with District Counsel on this matter and will report back when she returns
from vacation next week.

On Tue, Jun 17, 2025 at 3:15 PM Info Gms <info@gms-tampa.com> wrote:
The District is in receipt of your public records request dated 6/17/25. Your request will
be processed in accordance with the District's Rules and Policies and Florida Law.

On Tue, Jun 17, 2025 at 3:12 PM Steve Lockom <slockom@yahoo.com> wrote:

On May 6 on check # 5058 a payment of $79,638.83 was made to Rightway
Restoration. This check was a down payment on a job costing around $398K.
Please send me a copy of the contract and or paperwork that details the
$398K restoration project.

Thanks,
Steve

Steve Lockom
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